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STUDENT HONORS AND AWARDS 
 
The school district shall provide a program that establishes honors and awards including, 
but not limited to, academic letters, scholarships and good citizenship awards for students 
to assist them in setting goals.  Students shall be made aware of honors and awards and 
the action necessary on the part of the student to achieve them.   
 
Honor Roll and Down List 
An honor roll will be compiled and posted at the end of each nine-week period and at the 
end of each semester.  There are three levels of honor rolls:  4.0, 3.5, 3.0 (Note: P.E. and 
music are not included when figuring honor roll percentages.) 
 
Because academics are the primary reason for attending school, students who are failing 
in more than one subject area will be ineligible to participate in school activities for a one 
week period.  Beginning on the third week of the year and the last school day of each 
week following, teachers will submit names of those students who are near failing or are 
failing in their classes.  A student deemed ineligible could continue to practice but may 
not participate in activity events for the following week (Monday through Sunday). 
 
Valedictorian and Salutatorian 
The senior student with the highest four-year scholastic average shall be declared the 
valedictorian; the student with the next highest scholastic average will be declared the 
salutatorian.  In establishing scholastic average, grade point average will be rounded to 
the nearest one thousandth. 
 
Only students who have attended the Creighton Community Public School for their final 
four semesters of their academic career will be considered for the valedictorian or 
salutatorian award. 
 
All students who graduated with a grade point average of 3.5, or higher, will be 
considered honor students and will be recognized at graduation.  All Students who 
graduated with a grade point average of 4.0, or higher, will be considered graduates with 
high honors and will be recognized at graduation. 
 
Cross Reference: 506 Student Activities 
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